11 North Third Street

City Of JaC kSOﬂVi"e BeaCh Jacksonville Beach, Florida

Agenda
City Council

Monday, December 21, 2015 7:00 PM Councii Chambers

MEMORANDUM TO:

The Honorable Mayor and
Members of the City Council

City of Jacksonville Beach, Florida

Council Members:

The following Agenda of Business has been prepared for consideration and action at the Regular
Meeting of the City Council.

OPENING CEREMONIES:
INVOCATION, FOLLOWED BY SALUTE TO THE FLAG
ROLL CALL

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

a. 15-201 Regular City Council Meeting Held December 7, 2015

ANNOUNCEMENTS

COURTESY OF THE FLOOR TO VISITORS

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

a. 15-202 Red Bull Night Riders Presentation

b. 15-203 ISO Fire Protection Rating Presentation

c.  15-211 Request by City Attorney for Shade Meeting
CITY CLERK

CITY MANAGER
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City Council

Agenda December 21, 2015

a. 15-204

b. 15-205

c. 15-206

d. 15-207

e. 15-210
RESOLUTIONS
a. 15-208
ORDINANCES
a. 15-209
ADJOURNMENT
NOTICE

Accept the Monthly Financial Reports for the Month of November 2015.
Approve the Annual 26.2 with Donna Marathon.

Approve Funding for Temporary Part-time Special Projects Manager for
Parks & Recreation.

Award Unit Price Bid Number 1415-12, "Ocean Forest Drainage
Improvements Project (Parts A & B)," to G & H Underground Construction,
Inc., and Authorize Construction Administration Services with the Project
Design Firm Jones Edmunds & Associates, Inc.

Award Unit Price Bid Number 1516-01, "Downtown Redevelopment District
Infrastructure Improvements, Phase IlIC - Project 1," to J.B. Coxwell
Contracting, Inc., and Authorize Construction Administration Services with
the Project Design Firm, GAI Consultants, Inc.

RESOLUTION NO. 1956-2015

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF JACKSONVILLE BEACH, FLORIDA,
AMENDING THE PERSONNEL POLICIES RELATING TO EMPLOYEE
DONATIONS OF VACATION LEAVE IN THE EVENT OF A
CATASTROPHIC iLLNESS, EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 21, 2015.

ORDINANCE NO. 2015-8066 (First Reading)

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 30, ARTICLE IIl, OF THE CODE
OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF JACKSONVILLE BEACH BY
AMENDING SECTION 30-34(a), ADDITIONAL HOMESTEAD
EXEMPTIONS AUTHORIZED, ADDING SECTION 30-34(b) TO
AUTHORIZE AN ADDITIONAL EXEMPTION AND AMENDING SECTION
30-35, ANNUAL ADJUSTMENT TO HOUSEHOLD INCOME; PROVIDING
FOR SEVERABILITY; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ORDINANCES
IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE AND
PROVIDING DIRECTIONS TO THE CITY CLERK.

City of Jacksonville Beach
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City Council Agenda December 21, 2015

In accordance with Section 286.0105, Florida Statutes, any person desirous of appealing any decision reached at this
meeting may need a record of the proceedings. Such person may need to ensure that a verbatim record of the
proceedings is made, which record includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is to be based.

The public is encouraged fo speak on issues on this Agenda that concern them. Anyone who wishes to speak should
submit the request to the City Clerk or to the recording secretary prior to the beginning of the meeting. These forms
are available at the entrance of the City Council Chambers for your convenience.

In accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act and Section 286.26, Florida Statutes, persons with disabilities
needing special accommodation to participate in this meeting should contact the City Clerk’s Office at (904)
247-6299, extension 10, no later than one business day before the meeting.
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3) Signs for a legal nonconforming use:
a. New or additional signs for a nonconforming use shall not be permitted.

b. A nonconforming sign for a nonconforming use that ceases to be used for
a period of sixty (60) consecutive days or is replaced by a conforming use, shall be
considered a prohibited sign and shall be removed or brought into conformance upon
establishment of a conforming use.

“) Signs discontinued:

a. Sign structures that remain vacant, unoccupied or devoid of any meecaos,
e dionlawv a maccace nertainine tn a time event or purpose that no longer applif
shall be deemed to be discontinuea.

b. A nonconforming sign deemed discontinued shall immediately terminate
the right to maintain such sign.

c Gthin sy {60 daysafie sign structure has beet

discontinued, 1. shall be the responsibility us wic p1operty owner or the propeiiy vwier’s
authorized agent to remove the discontinued signandt  z¢ nd conceal any and
all damage to any other structure resulting from remova: of the sizu.

d. Removal of a discontinued nonconforming sign shall include all sign
support components, angle irons, poles, and other remnants of the discontinued sign, that
are not currently in use, or proposed for immediate reuse as evidenced by a sign permit
application for a permitted sign.

(3) Unsafe signs:

a. If the building official determines any sign or sign structure to be in an
unsafe condition, he/she shall immediately notify, in writing, the owner of such sign who
shall correct such condition within forty-eight (48) hours.

b. If the correction has not been made within forty-eight (48) hours, the
building official may have the sign removed if it creates a danger to the public safety or
have any necessary repairs or maintenance performed at the expense of the sign owner or
owner or lessee of the property upon which the sign is located.

Sec. 34-451. Miscellaneous Provisions.

(1)  Maintenance of Sign Location. For a sign requiring a sign permit, weeds and
grass shall be kept cut in front of, behind, underneath, and from around the base of the sign fora
minimum distance of ten (10) feet from the sign base, and there shall be no rubbish or debris
within ten (10) feet of the sign base or undemeath the sign.

(2)  Ingress and Egress Signs. For safety purposes and for traffic circulation puiposes,
permanent ingress and egress signs to a parcel are permitted provided the same do not exceed

Ordinance No. 2015-8065 Exhibit A, Page 33 of 35



Dear Mayor Latham and City Council Members,

The purpose of this letter is to sincerely thank the City of Jacksonville
Beach and its residents for hosting the 5™ annual Red Bull Night Riders surf
competition on Friday November 13™, 2015. More than 7,000 people lined
the Jacksonville Beach Pier to witness what was truly an amazing night of
pro surfing. When all was said and done, it was Jacksonville Beach local,
Cody Thompson, who won his 2" Red Bull Night Riders championship.

Red Bull Night Riders could not have been accomplished without the
help and support of the City of Jacksonville Beach and it’s residents. As a
thank you, Red Bull would like to present the city with a custom Red Bull
Night Riders surfboard that was signed by each of the six competing riders
in this year’s event. The signatures includes...

Cody Thompson - Jacksonville Beach, FL
Evan Thompson - Jacksonville Beach, FL
Tristan Thompson - Jacksonville Beach, FL
Oliver Kurt - Melbourne Beach, FL
Balaram Stack - New York, NY

Randy Townsend - Surf City, NJ

We thank you once again for helping bring big air surfing to the night
sky of Jacksonville Beach and look forward to a continued partnership in
the years to come.

Sincerely,
Alexander Berg Bridget Jones
Field Marketing Manager Field Marketing Specialist

Red Bull North America Red Bull North America









MEMORANDUM

TO: George Forbes, City Manager

FROM: Susan Smith Erdelyi
City Attorney

DATE: December 16, 2015

RE: 286.011 Executive Session (Shade Meetings) on Pending
Litigation

ACTION REQUESTED

Schedule five shade meetings pursuant to Florida Statute 286.011(8) to discuss
pending litigation.

BACKGROUND

As the City Attorney, | am requesting that the City Council agree to schedule five
shade meetings because | seek the City Council’s advice concerning settlement
negotiations and/or litigation expenditures in the cases of:

1. Brothers Five v. City of Jacksonville Beach ~ Case No. 2014 CA
6762 Div. B Circuit Court Duval County

2. Brothers Five v. Cily of Jacksonville Beach — Case No. 2015 CA
2623 Div. G Circuit Court Duval County

3. Brothers Five v. City of Jacksonville Beach — Case No. 2015 CA
2716 Div. H Circuit Court Duval County

4. Brothers Five v. City of Jacksonville Beach — Case No. 2015 CA
3077 Div. C Circuit Court Duval County

5. Duval Royal Investments, Inc. and Brothers Five of Jacksonville
v. City of Jacksonville Beach, Case No. 3:15-cv-1163-J-32-JRK
Federal District Court

If the Council will agree to set these meetings, they will be attended by:

Mayor Charlie Latham, Counciimembers Jeanell Wilson, Christine Hoffman,
Keith Doherty, Phil Vogelsang, Lee Buck and Bruce Thomason, the City’s



outside attorney in these cases, William Brinton, City Manager George Forbes
and City Attorney Susan Erdelyi.

The proposed date for the meetings will be Tuesday January 19, 2016 at 5:15
p.m.

ECOMMENDATION

Schedule five shade meetings pursuant to Fla. Stats. 286.011 on Tuesday,
January 19, 2016 at 5:15 p.m. as described in a memo from the City Attorney
dated December 16, 2015.



MEMORANDUM

TO: George D. Forbes, City Manager

FROM: Karen Nelson, Chief Financial Officer
SUBJECT:  Monthly Financial Reports for November 2015
DATE: December 8, 2015

Action Requested

Accept the monthly financial reports for the month of November 2015.

Background

The monthly financial reports for November 2015 are being provided for your
information and review. These reports can be found in the “Reports and
Information” portion of this agenda.

Rec~mendati~~

Accept the monthly financial reports for the month of November 2015, as
submitted by the Chief Financial Officer.



TO: George D. Forbes, City Manager
FROM: Patrick K. Dooley, Chief of Police
DATE: December 9, 2015

SUBJECT: Presentation of the 26.2 with Donna Marathon Scheduled for
February 14, 2016

ACTION REQUESTED

Receive information on the annual 26.2 with Donna marathon.
BACKGROUND

The 9th annual 26.2 with Donna national marathon to raise funds for
breast cancer research is scheduled for February 14, 2016. The event will
once again begin at the Players Championship parking lot in St. Johns
County. The race starts at 7:30 a.m. The route will take runners through
Ponte Vedra Beach, Jacksonville Beach, Neptune Beach, and Atlantic
Beach before concluding at Mayo Clinic in Jacksonville via crossing the J.
Turner Butler bridge. The route through Jacksonville Beach will begin on
Ponte Vedra Boulevard.

A change has been implemented to the route this year. The runners will
not run on the beach; instead, the full marathon runners will continue north
on 15 Street to 16" Avenue, North. The half marathon runners will turn
west on 2" Avenue, North, then south on 2™ Street to 16" Avenue,
South.

Entertainment (live bands) will occur throughout the route during the run.
The enter nmentwill not startt o 8:00 a.m. Sound and decibel levels
must be in compliance with the City's noise ordinance. Entertainment
locations are:

« 37th Avenue, South, and A1A (in the grassy area)
*1st Street, South, and 25th Avenue, South
*1st Street, North, and 5th Avenue, North



*1st Street, North, and 1st Avenue, North
«1st Street, North, and Beach Boulevard
*1st Street, South, and 5th Avenue South
+1st Street, South, and 16th Avenue, South

While the event may create some delays for residents and businesses
along the route, City employees and marathon officials will work to keep
problems at a minimum. As in previous marathons, intersections along the
route will be controlled by a combination of barricades, police officers,
police volunteers, and marathon volunteers. The route will be closed on
the morning of the race and will re-open by approximately 4 p.m. The
police will monitor and allow people to exit as safely as possible. The
marathon volunteers and City will inform citizens who may be affected by
the race by the following methods:

v Door to door street team
v" Reverse 9-1-1 notification call prior to race
v" Map on web site

RECOMMENDATION

Approve the 26.2 with Donna marathon as detailed in a memo from Police
Chief Patrick K. Dooley dated December 9, 2015.















MEMORANDUM

TO: Mayor Latham
City Council Members

FROM: George D. Forbes
City Manager

DATE: December 10, 2015

SUBJECT:  Approve funding for temporary part-time special projects manager
for Parks & Recreation

ACTION REQUESTED

Approve funding for a temporary part-time special projects manager for Parks &
Recreation.

BACKGROUND

For over 30 years, Gary Meadors has served the City well, first as a Golf Course
Maintenance Supervisor, and later as a Landscape/Parks Maintenance Director
and finally as the Parks & Recreation Director. His knowledge of the history and
requirements of the City’s parks, recreation facilities and landscaped areas is
unsurpassed. Mr. Meadors will be retiring on January 2, 2016. A search for a
new Parks & Recreation Director is currently underway.

To help manage the transition to a new Parks & Recreation Director, Gary has
indicated his willingness to work part-time on special projects such as the
conversion of the paper cemetery records and maps to a digital format, and to
manage some of our larger parks improvement projects (Oceanfront Park and
Cradle C :k) among other projects.

This temporary, part-time positon would be budgeted for 15-20 hours per week
for the next 12 to 18 months. If approved, funding will be from the General Fund
unallocated account and the 2016 budget will be adjusted by $31,589 in the mid-
year budget adjustment. Funding for FY2017 will be included in the FY2017
budget.



RECOMMENDATION:

Approve the addition of a temporary, part-time position in the Parks & Recreation
Department as described in a memo from the City Manager dated December 10,
2015.



December 10, 2015
TO: George Forbes, City Manager
FROM: Ty Edwards, Public Works

SUBJECT: Award Bid 1415-12, Ocean Forest Drainage improvements Project
(Parts A & B)

ACTION REQUESTED:

Award Unit Price Bid Number 1415-12, “Ocean Forest Drainage Improvements
Project (Parts A & B),”to G & H Underground Construction, Inc., and authorize
Construction Administration Services with the project design firm, Jones Edmunds &
Associates, Inc.

BACKGROUND:

This project is part of the stormwater improvements program, in the City’s Capital
Improvement Plan, where existing deteriorated stormwater pipes are being replaced
/ enhanced over time. The Ocean Forest Subdivision, one of the City’s older
neighborhoods, is the focus of this project.

Project Limits

North | Tallwood Road / Oakwood Road / Arden Way
South | 12™ Avenue North

East Sunset Drive

West Tallwood Road

The project was divided into two parts based on accessibility of the work locations.

Project Work Summary
Part A Part B
(in unconfined locations) (in confined locations)
¢ Replace 2600 LF (+/-) of old, galvanized ¢ Install Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP)
metal storm pipe with new ranging in size: as liner inside 1715 LF (+/-) of old

o from 15" diameter PVC pipe storm pipe ranging in size:

o to 36" diameter RCP pipe o from 15" galvanized metal pipe
¢ Install 4 new concrete headwalls o to 24" galvanized metal pipe
¢ Install 2 new & replace 4 old storm

manholes
¢ Install 1 new concrete gravity wall
e Install concrete rip-rap & geotextile fabric
for erosion mitigation
¢ Remove & replace 1 concrete flume
¢ Remove & replace curb/gutter & sidewalk
¢ Install 3 new & replace 36 old storm inlets
e Water & gravity sewer adjustments
in conflict with the gravity stormwater work




1s advertised, eleven (11) bid packages were requested and
sived. The City’s design engineer firm, Jones Edmunds &
ated the bids and recommends award to G & H

iction, Inc., the lowest, qualified bidder. The bid tabulation
construction cost and staff recommendation are summarized

Unit Price Bid No: 1415-12,
st Drainage Improvements Project (Parts A & B)

Stormwater

Water/Sewer

Costs Costs Total RECOMMENDATION
1,045,173.40 | $257,958.00 | $1,303,131.40 | « Award bid to G&H
Underground
$104,517.60 $25,795.00 $130,312.60 | Construction, Inc.,
1.149,691.00 | $283,753.00 | $1,433,444.00 | (lowest qualified bidder)
$17,027.63 $4,202.57 $21,230.20 | e Authorize C&A with
Jones Edmunds &
$1,702.37 $420.43 $2,122.80 | Associates, Inc.
$18,730.00 $4,623.00 $23,353.00 | (project’s design firm)
11,168,421.00 | $288,376.00 | $1,456,797.00 |

t was budgeted in FY2014 and FY2015 for construction a '

itly, it was decided to bid and construct as one project.

e added to the FY2016 Public Works budget from fund balances
ds - Water & Sewer ($288,376) and Stormwater ($1,168,421).

t Unit Price Bid 1415-12, “Ocean Forest Drainage

(Parts A & B),” be awarded to the lowest, qualified bidder,
Jtility Construction, Inc. at a cost, based on estimated
31.40, plus a 10% contingency, for a total cost not to exceed

t Construction Administration Services be authorized with the
lones Edmunds & Associates, Inc., at a total cost, based on
0.20, plus a 10% contingency, for a total cost not to exceed

lumber 1415-12, titled “Ocean Forest Drainage

(Parts A and B)” to the lowest, qualified bidder, G & H
uction, Incorporated, and authorize Construction

's with the project’s design firm, Jones Edmunds and
‘ated, as explained in the memorandum from the Public
December 10, 2015.




City of Jacksonville Beach Bid Tabulation Form
Bid Number 1415-12, “Ocean Forest Drainage Improvements Project
(Parts A & B)”

Date: November 4, 2015

Vendor A Vendor B Vendor C
Part A $1,006,551.80 $1,483,596.50 | $1,484,330.00
Part B $296,579.60 No Bid No Bid
Total
1,303,131.4 N/A N/A
Parts A& B $1,303,131.40
Invitations Plan Holders: 11 Bids Responses:
Issued: 19 3
VENDORS
" VendorA |G&H Underground Utility Construction, Inc. —
Lowest, Qualified Bidder
Vendor B J. B. Coxwell Contracting, Inc.

Vendor C

Petticoat-Schmitt Civil Contractors, Inc.










Dennis Dupries, Construction Project Manager
November 13, 2015
Page 3

We appreciate this opportunity to be of service to the City of Jacksonville Beach and look
forward to the successful construction of this project. If you have any questions, please feel free
to contact me at (904) 744-5401 or bhepburn@jonesedmunds.com.

Brian F. Hepburnh, MPA
Project Manager

K:\09803 Jacksonvills Beach¥030-02 OCEAN FOREST PSDC\3 - Construction\WNotice of AwardRECAWARD LTR.doc

Enclosure




December 10,

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT:

2015

George Forbes, City Manager

Ty Edwards, Public Works

Award Unit Price Bid No. 1516-01, Downtown Redevelopment
District Infrastructure Improvements, Phase {lIC — Project 1

ACTION REQUESTED:

Award Unit Price Bid Number 1516-01, “Downtown Redevelopment District
Infrastructure Improvements, Phase llIC — Project 1,” to J.B. Coxwell Contracting,
Inc., and authorize Construction Administration Services with the project design
firm, GAl Consultants, Inc.

BACKGROUND:

The City of Jacksonvilie Beach is continuing the implementation of the Downtown
Redevelopment District Vision Plan to enhance the overall community quality of
life. Phase IlIC — Project 1 begins the improvements to the south of Beach
Boulevard, east of 3 Street (A1A).

Project Area Limits

North
South

- Beach Boulevard
- 4™ Avenue South

East - Avenue end zones

West - 3™ Street South

PROJECT WORK SUMMARY

¢ Rebuild roads and curb & gutter

¢ Install new and rebuild existing
stormwater drainage systems

¢ Install new & rebuild old on-street

parking

¢ Rebuild sidewalks & driveway aprons

¢ Rebuild water and sanitary sewer
sys’ ns including fire hydrants

¢ Install new & relocate existing street

light poles

o Install wider bike lanes on 1% Street South

¢ Relocate utilities corridors next to outside
edge of road rights-of-way

e Concrete pave all alleyways for better
drainage and vehicle access

e Demo roads, curbs, sidewalks, trees, etc.

¢ Relocate/replace dumpster enclosures in
alleys

¢ Paver enhancements to avenue bulb-outs &
eastside 1% St. sidewalk to Oceanfront Park

A public hearing for the pre-qualification procedure for this project was held on
October 23, 2015. The project was advertised and seven (7) contractors submitted
pre-qualification applications on November 6, 2015. All seven (7) of these
contractors were determined to be pre-qualified by the engineer to bid on this
project. On November 19, 2015, a non-mandatory pre-bid meeting was held and
six (6) pre-qualified bidders attended. Five (5) pre-qualified contractors







RECOMMENDATON:

Award Unit Price Bid Number 1516-01, titled “Downtown Redevelopment District
Infrastructure Improvements, Phase IlIC — Project 1” to J.B. Coxwell Contracting,
Incorporated, authorize Construction Administration Services with the project’s
design firm, GAI Consultants, Incorporated, and authorize Construction
Inspection Services through the City’s Public Works Department, as described in
the memorandum from the Public Works Director dated December 10, 2015.



City of Jacksonville Beach Bid Tabulation Form
Bid Number 1516-01, “Phase IIIC-Project 1 Infrastructure
Improvements Project”

Date: December 9, 2015
BIDDERS
A *B C *D E
Total $5’495’646.80 $5,932,350.07 | $5,998,053.09 | $6,369,463.32 | $7,653,603.45
Bid
F G
No Bid No Bid
*Corrected Bids
Invitations Issued: 12 Pre-Qualified Plan Holders: 7 | Bid Responses: 5
Bidders
A | J.B. Coxwell Contracting, Inc.— Lowest, Qualified Bidder
B Grimes Utilities, Inc.
C Petticoat-Schmitt Civil Contractors, Inc.
D United Brothers Development Corporation
]3; Watean (vl ConstructiorL Tne L L o
F A.J.Jonns, Inc.
G Miranda Contracting, LLC
12/11/2015







gaiconsL ants

transforming ideas into reality

December 11, 2015

Mr. Dennis Dupries
Construction Project Manager
Department of Public Works
City of Jacksonville Beach
1460-A Shetter Ave.-2nd Floor
Jacksonville Beach, FI. 32250

RE:  Phase IlIC Project 1 Infrastructure Improvements
Jacksonville Beach, FL
City Bid Number: 1516-01
Recommendation for Award

Dear Mr. Dupries,

We are pleased to enclose the bid tabulation for the five (5) bids for the referenced project. The bids have
been checked for mathematical errors, verified and evaluated for conformance with the criteria set forth in
the bidding documents.

JB Coxwell Contracting Inc. is the low bidder for the project with a Base Bid of $5,495,646.80.

Based on the availability of Redevelopment Tax Increment Trust Funds, we recommend award of the
Base Bid to JB Coxwell Contracting Inc. for a total of $5,495,646.80. In addition, we recommend a 10%
contingency be included for unforeseen circumstances during construction. The Base Bid including a
10% contingency amount is $6,045,211.48.

We appreciate this opportunity to be of service to the City of Jacksonville Beach and look forward to the
successful construction of this project.

Sincerely,
GALI Consultants, Inc.

Matthew Bolyard, PE
Senior Project Engineer

cc: Martin Martirone, City Engineer
Steve Lindorff, Director of Planning & Development

1301 Riverplace Blvd., Suite 900 Jacksonville, FL 32207 Tel 904.363.1110 Fax 904.363.1115 Www.gaiconsultants.com



® gaiconsultants

transforming ideas into reality

December 4, 2015

Mr. Marty Martirone

City of Jacksonville Beach

1460A Shetter Avenue
Jacksonville Beach, Florida 32250

Subject: Phase 3C Project 1 Infrastructure Improvements
Fee Proposal for Post Design Services
GAI Project No.: B111188.00
Jacksonville Beach, Florida

Dear Mr. Martirone,

We are pleased to submit to you this Not-to-Exceed Fee to provide Post Design Services to the City of
Jacksonville Beach for the subject project. The fee is based on a 550 day proposed construction timeline. The
services are for post design only and do not include Construction Administration or Construction Engineering and
Inspection (CEI) Services.

The scope of work shall include:

o Public Meetings, Progress Meetings, Pre-Construction Meeting, Meeting Preparation, Attendance
and Meeting Minutes

(78) Site Visits (1 site visit per week)

Shop Drawing Reviews

RFI Analysis and Responses

Plan Revisions

Review and Approve Monthly Pay Applications

Review Contractor MOT Plans

Attend Final Inspection and Prepare Punch List

FDEP Water and Sewer COCC Documents

As Built Record Drawing Reviews

Final Change Order and Approval of all closeout documents

Total Fee for Phase 3C Project 1 Infrastructure Improvements Post Design Fee

Total GAI Consultants Fee con $125,334.00
A summary breakdown of the proposed GAI Consultants fee is attached.
We look forward to assisting you on this important project. Additional full time CEI Services can be
provided by GAI under a separate scope and fee to monitor daily construction activities at the City of Jacksonville

Beach’s request. Please contact myself at (904) 363-1110 x 2005 or Matt Bolyard (904) 363-1110 x 2023 with
any questions or comments regarding this proposal.

1301 Riverplace Blvd., Suite 900 Jacksonville, FL 32207 Tel 904.363.1110 Fax 904.363.1115 www.gaiconsultants.com




Sincerely,
GAI Consultants, Inc.

Y o=

Kevin Leadbetter, P.E.
Vice President/Managing Officer

® gai consultants

transforming Ideas into reality




MEMORANDUM

TO: George D. Forbes, City Manager

FROM: Ann Meuse, Human Resources Director /4/W\'/

SUBJECT: Resolution Number 1956-2015, Amending the Personnel Policies,
Effective December 21, 2015.
DATE: December 3, 2015

ACTION REQUESTED
Adopt Resolution Number 1956-2015, amending Chapter 4 of the Personnel

Policies to remove the 5 day minimum hospitalization requirement included in the
definition of a catastrophic iliness for the purpose of employee vacation leave

donations.

BACKGROUND

The City recognized that during times of serious illness, an employee’s financial

integrity is often at risk and established a leave donation policy in 2012 that
allows full-time City employees to donate accrued vacation leave to other
employees within the City in the event of a catastrophic illness. According to the

City policy, catastrophic illness is defined as follows:

“Catastrophic illness is defined as a) a life threatening illness that
requires hospitalization of a minimum of five days and recovery at home
or in another facility (the hospitalization must not be due to elective

surgery) or b) a disease or illness certified by a duly licensed physician
practicing within the scope of the physician’s license which disables the
individual from | forming all his/her job functions for an extended

period of time (at least 30 calendar days).”

Medical treatment for life threatening illnesses continues to change dramatically
and it is not unusual for individuals suffering from a catastrophic illness to

experience hospital stays less than the five day minimum required in the City



Memorandum to George D. Forbes
December 3, 2015
Page 2 of 2

policy. This has resulted in some employees, who are suffering catastrophic life
threatening illnesses, not being eligible for donated leave from their fellow

employees, which was never the intent of the policy.

In order to correct this situation the policy has been amended (see pages 4-13
and 4-14 of Attachment A) to remove the 5 day minimum hospitalization

requirement in the definition of a catastrophic iliness.

RECOMMENDATION
Adopt Resolution Number 1956-2015, amending the Personnel Policies to

remove the 5 day minimum hospitalization requirement included in the definition

of a catastrophic iliness for the purpose of employee vacation leave donations.



Introduced By:

Adopted:

RESOLUTION NO. 1956-2015

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF JACKSONVILLE BEACH,
FLORIDA, AMENDING THE PERSONNEL POLICIES RELATING
TO EMPLOYEE DONATIONS OF VACATION LEAVE IN THE
EVENT OF A CATASTROPHIC ILLNESS, EFFECTIVE
DECEMBER 21, 2015.

WHEREAS the City has adopted a comprehensive set of Personnel Policies, and

WHEREAS it is necessary to periodically update those policies to reflect professional
personnel practices and meet the needs of the City and its employees, and

WHEREAS the City’s current policy for vacation leave donation for catastrophic
illness defines a catastrophic illness as a life threatening illness that requires hospitalization of
a minimum of five days, and

WHEREAS medical treatment for life threatening illnesses continues to change and it
is not unusual for individuals suffering from a catastrophic illness to experience hospitalization
less than the five day minimum required in the City policy.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
JACKSONVILLE BEACH, FLORIDA, THAT:

SECTION 1. The City hereby amends Chapter 4 of the Personnel Policies to remove
the five day minimum hospitalization requirement for an employee to qualify for the donation
of vacation leave in the event of a catastrophic illness as shown in Attachment A, dated
December 21, 2015, and hereby made part of this resolution.

SECTION 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized to implement the amended
Personnel Policies and take any action necessary to carry out implementation not in conflict
with any other laws or ordinances.

SECTION 3. This resolution shall take effect December 21, 2015

AUTHENTICATED this day of 2015.

William C. Latham, MAYOR

Laurie Scott, CITY CLERK
Resolution No. 1956-2015 Page | of 1



Personnel Policies Effective ATTACHMENT A

14.

Any amount paid by the City to the employee which is subsequently paid
by Workers” Compensation, shall be reimbursed by the employee to the
City.

On-The-Job-Injury Leave may be granted in addition to normal accrued
sick or annual leave. Medical review may be required by the City to
continue this leave. The employee shall be responsible to provide all
medical documentation to the City so that a determination of his fitness for
duty can be made. The City Manager shall have the right to
suspend/terminate this benefit at any time.

An employee sustaining a lost time injury may use accumulated sick,
annual, compensatory time and/or personal leave to cover the time off the
job due to injury until he is compensated by Workers” Compensation.
Sick, annual, compensatory time and/or personal leave can be used to
supplement that percentage (33-1/3) of his pay which is not covered by

" Workers’ Compensation. The request permitting the employee to do the

above must be made through his/her department.

An employee receiving any On-the-Job Injury, Sick or Annual leave
benefits under the provisions of this section shall not work at any
secondary jobs. Violation of this section shall result in automatic
termination.

Sick and Annual Leave shall continue to accrue while an individual is
absent due to workers’ compensation injury unless he/she is in (LWOP)
Leave Without Pay Status.

Vacation Leave Donation for Catastrophic Illness. Any full-time City
employee who suffers a catastrophic illness and has exhausted his/her
accumulated leave (compensatory time, sick leave, personal leave, vacation, etc.)
may be eligible to receive vacation leave donations from other employees within
the City.

a.

Catastrophic illness is defined as a) a life threatening illness that requires
hospitalization nd recovery at home or in
another facility (the hospitalization must not be di to ective surgery) or
b) a disease or illness certified by a duly licensed physician practicing
within the scope of the physician’s license which disables the individual
from performing all his/her job functions for an extended period of time
(at least 30 calendar days).

Employees may request this leave donation by submitting a leave request

with appropriate medical certification to their supervisor two weeks in
advance of when the leave donation is needed. Failure to provide notice
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two weeks in advance may result in denial of the leave donation unless,
due to circumstances beyond the employee’s control, the appropriate
notice could not be given. The Department Director may also initiate a
request for vacation leave donation.

c. Payment begins on the first day following a five consecutive unpaid work
day elimination period.

d. Employees who wish to donate vacation leave to another employee’s sick
account for catastrophic illness (as. defined above) may do so by
completing a vacation leave donation form and submitting it to the
Department Director. The maximum donation allowed per incident from
any one employee is 40 hours. Employees making the donation must have
a minimum 80 hour balance in order to donate. Donations must be made in
increments of not less than eight hours.

e. The maximum leave donation allowable to any one employee is 240
hours per catastrophic event.

f. Any donated vacation leave that is unused shall be returned to the
donor(s) in an amount equal to the donor’s pro-rated share of the total
hours donated.

g. The City Manager or his/her designee shall have sole discretion in
approving any leave donation request. No provision of this section is
subject to the grievance procedure.



MEMORANDUM

TO: George D. Forbes, City Manager

FROM: Karen Nelson, Chief Financial Officer

SUBJECT:  Ordinance Number 2015-8066, Amending Chapter 30, Article lll,
“Additional Homestead Exemptions”, of the Code of Ordinances

DATE: December 10, 2015

ACTION REQUESTED

Adopt Ordinance Number 2015-8066, amending Chapter 30, Article llI, of the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Jacksonville Beach to authorize an additional
Senior Homestead Exemption for homeowners meeting certain criteria as
defined in the Florida Statutes.

BACKGROUND
Florida Statutes §196.075(2) authorized a property tax exemption for limited-

income homesteaded senior citizens who meet certain criteria. According to
statute, municipalities may grant this additional exemption by ordinance adopted
in the manner prescribed by general law. The City Council adopted Ordinance
Number 2000-7787 on April 3, 2000, authorizing the additional homestead
exemption of $25,000 for any person who:

e Has the legal or equitable title to real estate, and
¢ Maintains thereon the permanent residence of the owner, and
¢ Has attained the age of 65, and

¢ Whose household income does not exceed $20,000

In November 2012, the Florida Legislature amended §196.075 to add a second
additional senior homestead exemption in an amount up to the assessed value of
the homesteaded property. To qualify for the second additional exemption, the
home’s just (market) value on record must be less than $250,000.
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In addition, qualified applicants must:

e Have legal or equitable title to the property, and

e Have resided on the property for no less than 25 years, and

e Be 65 or older, and

e Meet annual limited income requirements prescribed in FS §196.075 (the
limitation for 2015 is $28,448)

The new law could provide a qualifying property owner with a total exemption
from the City’s portion of property taxes. For those who do not meet the criteria
of the new exemption, the existing income-based senior exemption (up to
$25,000 off the assessed value for municipal levies) is not impacted and remains
available for those who qualify.

Ordinance Number 2015-8066, authorizing the second exemption, will become
effective on January 1, 2017 and will be administered through the Exemptions
Division of the Duval County Property Appraiser's Office. The impact on the
City’s budget will be realized in the subsequent year as a reduction to ad valorem
tax revenues. The dollar amount of the impact depends on the number of
qualified property owners that make application for the exemption, but it is
expected to be insignificant to the total amount of the tax assessment.

RECONM""=NDATION
Adopt Ordinance Number 2015-8066, amending Chapter 30, Article I,
“Additional Homestead Exemptions”, of the Code of Ordinances of the City of

Jacksonville Beach to provide a second additional Senior Homestead Exemption.



Introduced By:
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2nd Reading: ___

ORDINANCE NO. 2015-8066

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 30, ARTICLE Ili, OF
THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
JACKSONVILLE BEACH BY AMENDING SECTION 30-34 (a),
ADDITIONAL HOMESTEAD EXEMPTIONS AUTHORIZED,
ADDING SECTION 30-34(b) TO AUTHORIZE AN ADDITIONAL
EXEMPTION AND AMENDING SECTION 30-35, ANNUAL
ADJUSTMENT TO HOUSEHOLD INCOME; PROVIDING FOR
SEVERABILITY; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; PROVIDING AN
EFFECTIVE DATE AND PROVIDING DIRECTIONS TO THE
CITY CLERK.

WHEREAS, Article VI, §6(d), Florida Constitution, authorizes the State
Legislature to enact a general law allowing local governments, for the purpose of their
respective tax levies, to grant an additional homestead exemption; and

WHEREAS, Article VII, §6(d), Florida Constitution, provides for an additional
homestead exemption equal to the assessed value of the property for any person who
has the legal or equitable title to real estate with a just value less than $250,000 and
who has maintained thereon the permanent residence of the owner for not less than
twenty-five years and who has attained age 65 and whose household income does not
exceed low income as defined by general law; and

WHEREAS, the State Legislature enacted Chapter 2012-57, Laws of Florida,
amending §196.075, Florida Statutes, implementing Article VI, §6(d), Florida
Constitution, effective July 1, 2013; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Jacksonville Beach desires to provide
for an additional homestead exemption within the provisions and limitations of Article
VII, §6(d), Florida Constitution, Chapter 2012-57, Laws of Florida, and §196.075, Florida
Statutes; and

WHEREAS, the additional homestead exemption should be in the form of an or-
dinance and should be delivered to the Duval County Property Appraiser no later than
December 1, 2016 to be effective in the 2017 tax year,
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